
Ref No : VDC/5896/18MEG-01/3001048 Application Date : 12-09-2023

This is to certify that

DURGA VALVES PVT. LTD.

has been enlisted for the supply of materials as per the details given below:

MEG No 18MEG-01 (GENERAL PURPOSE MANUALLY OPERATED CI GATE VALVES/SLUICE VALVES)

Average Turnover(AATO) INR 18,34,51,944.00

Execution Capability INR 6,37,712.00

Communication Address Ichapur Road, Canal Side, Santragachi, Howrah-711104 (W.B.)

Work Address Address 1 . :Ichapur Road, Canal Side, Santragachi, Howrah-711104,Howrah,West Bengal(711104)

Validity 12-09-2024 to 11-09-2027

This Certificate will remain valid unless overridden otherwise, Subject to Terms and Condition attached
with this certificate.We look forward to have a fair, transparent and mutually beneficial long term
relationship with you and contribute towards growth of our nation.

For and on behalf of NTPC Limited
UPENDRA   KUMAR
(SENIOR MANAGER)
NTPC Limited
12-09-2024



Important Notice for compliance by an Enlisted Vendor:

Conflict of Interest:

An enlisted vendor during their participation in a Tender as a bidder should ensure that they do not have
conflict of interest with other bidders. Such conflict of interest can lead to anticompetitive practices to the
detriment of Employer’s interests. The criteria based on which a bidder shall be considered to have a
conflict of interest with one or more parties in the bidding process, shall be as per provisions of the bidding
documents of the specific Tender.

During the bidding process/bids invited amongst the enlisted parties, the bidder shall have to submit their
acceptance/compliance of provisions of Bidding Documents, regarding “Conflict of Interest”.

In case it is established that Bidder has provided any false information in pursuance of the aforesaid Clause,
while competing for the contract, then its bid shall be rejected and EMD/bid security shall be forfeited. In
case of a successful bidder, if it is established that the Bidder has not complied with terms of aforesaid
Clause, during execution of contract, this would be considered as fraudulent practice as mentioned in para
5.1 (j) of “Policy for Debarment from Business Dealings” and shall be dealt accordingly.



Terms & conditions

a) This enlistment does not confer any rights to the vendor for supply of materials/services to NTPC
Limited. The Vendor will be considered for issue of tender enquiry by NTPC power stations/offices as per
eligibility criteria defined at clause no. 20.0/21.0/22.0 off standard terms & conditions of enlistment.
Decision of tendering authority (NTPC respective power station/ offices) will be final and binding in this
regards.

b) On-Line Vendor Enlistment Portal is kept open for vendor to update/ upgrade their credentials time to
time as per Enlistment Calendar. It is advisable to update/ upgrade with the change of any of status /
information furnished.

c) NTPC reserves the right to cancel the enlistment at any time with prior notice to the enlisted vendors due
to change in QR or Technical specifications or any reason in the interest of NTPC. Preferably 6 months
advance notice shall be given to the enlisted vendors and during that period fresh enlistment based on the
revised QR & Tech specifications may be completed so that immediately after the cutoff date, procurement
can take place based on the newly enlisted vendors.

d) This certificate is subject to the STANDARD TERMS & CONDITIONS (STC) FOR ENLISTMENT
available on our enlistment web portal based on which enlistment has been done. Note:- This document is
computer generated and does not require signature.


